

Erik R. Johnson & Associates, Ltd
Attorneys at Law

Erik R. Johnson - Nancy J. Morris - Jason T. Loos
505 Broadway - Suite 206
Fargo, ND 58102
(701) 280-1901

Invoice #
2243-

Invoice

City of Fargo -- Auditor's Office
Attn: Kent Costin
200 North 3rd Street
Fargo, ND 58102

Date	2/25/2015
------	-----------

Description	Qty	Rate	Amount
Metro Flood Project (General legal matters):	22.05	204.00	4,498.20
Erik Johnson-Jan 26 thru Feb 25, 2015: Itemization enclosed			
Nancy J Morris-Jan 26 thru Feb 25, 2015: Itemization enclosed	9.1	178.50	1,624.35
<i>We appreciate your business.</i>			TOTAL: \$6,122.55

Client: City of Fargo
Job: Metro Flood - General Legal

Atty	DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
E	1/29/2015	Review Rousaki's draft proposal and telephone conference with paul Tietz	1.4
E	1/30/2015	Communication re: OHB/Oxbow	0.50
E	1/30/2015	Conference with Pat Zavoral and Keith and telephone conference with Shockley	1
E	2/2/2015	Review PPA draft and conference call with Paul and Tom Waters re: PPA; email re: record request - Eric and Rocky	1
E	2/3/2015	Administrative advisory meeting	1.5
E	2/3/2015	Conference call with Cattanach and Drysdale; review Drysdale brief	1
E	2/4/2015	Review JPA	0.5
E	2/5/2015	Attend meeting and general city matters	1.75
E	2/6/2015	Attend legislative strategy discussion	2
E	2/6/2015	Attend PPA coordination session	1.5
E	2/6/2015	Attend General Weir meeting	0.5
E	2/11/2015	Telephone call with Bob and Mike and others re: meeting issues; telephone call with others re: meeting issues and communication with Bob and Maike; telephone call with Tami	1.3
E	2/12/2015	Emails with Cattanach	0.5
E	2/21/2015	Work on open record request challenge	0.4
E	2/24/2015	Conference call and call with Tami and Bob and Mike	1.5
E	2/24/2015	Work on open record request	1
E	2/25/2015	Cattanach and Drysdale; communications with Cattanach and Drysdale; work on record request response	3.7
E	2/25/2015	Finalize open record response	1
Total Time - ERJ			22.05
Hourly Rate - ERJ \$			204.00
Total Fees - ERJ \$			4498.20
N	1/28/2015	Review correspondence re: Bakke Eminent Domain; Correspond w/ J. Glanzmeier; Phone call w/ Erik	1.2
N	2/1/2015	Correspondence re: Open records response & litigation review	0.6
N	2/3/2015	Administrative meeting	1.5
N	2/5/2015	Diversion Authority Meeting	1.4
N	2/10/2015	Research contractor succession correspondence	2.9
N	2/19/2015	Administrative meeting	1.5
Total Time - NJM			9.10
Hourly Rate - NJM \$			178.50
Total Fees - NJM \$			1624.35